Joliet Junior College | |
Bid for Nursing & Ultrasound Program Instructional Equipment
11/30/2015
Pocket Nurse Products Unlimited Gaumard. Scientific Gaumard. Scientific Sundaes Novelty Laerdal Medical Armstrong Medical Moore Medical
(Option A) (Option B)
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION
1 1 30" OAKWORKS WOMEN’'S No bid $6,640.38 $6,640.38 |No bid No bid $6,749.00 $6,749.00 |No bid No bid No bid
IMAGING ULTRASOUND
TABLE; MANUAL SLIDING
CARDIO PANEL; COLOR:
OPAL
Model Oakworks Oakworks exact match
3yrs parts, 2yrs labor Manuf. 3 Years
Warranty
2 1 FETUS ULTRASOUND No bid $8,775.00 $8,775.00 |No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
EXAMINATION PHANTOM —
SPACEFAN-ST, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS
Model Kyoto Kagaku SPACEFAN-S
1 year
Warranty
3 5 ALARIS MEDLEY 8000 IV $734.50 $3,672.50 $682.00 $3,410.00 |No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $771.25 $3,856.25
PUMP PCU, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS
New or Refurbished|Refurbished Refurbished Refurbished
Model|Alaris 8000 Alaris 8000 Auxo Medical 8000 Alaris
3 Year 1 year 6 months
Warranty
4 5 ALARIS MEDLEY INFUSION $847.50 $4,237.50 $848.00 $4,240.00 |No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $1,040.00 $5,200.00
DRUG MODULE, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS
New or Refurbished|Refurbished Refurbished Refurbished
Model|Alaris 8100 Alaris 8100 Auxo Medical 8100 Alaris
Warranty|3 Year 1 Year 6 months
5 5 ALARIS IV SET GEM V/NV 2 $136.73 $683.65 $129.50 $647.50 |No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $127.50 $637.50
SMARTSITE 20D 20/CASE, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS
6 1 ALARIS SECONDARY ADMIN $77.40 $77.40| $71.25 $71.25 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $55.86 $55.86
SET 40” 50/CASE, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS
7 3 SIMPAD CAPABLE NURSING $2,579.91 $7,739.73| $4,545.00 $13,635.00| $12,384.00 $37,152.00| $8,295.00 $24,885.00 |No bid $4,898.00 $14,775.69| $4,288.00 $12,864.00| Direct Sell
ANNE, TAN SKIN
Laerdal 325-20050T Laerdal 325-05050B Gaumard S1001 Susie Gaumard S300.100 Code Laerdal 325-20050T Laerdal 325-20050T
Model Blue IlI
1 Year 1 Year 1 year limited, opt service 1 year limited, opt service Manufacturers Warranty, 1 Year
Warranty plan included plan included See Attached
8 3 $3,458.75 $10,376.25| $3,603.00 $10,809.00 |included included No bid $4,785.00 $14,385.00 $3,378.00 $10,134.00| $3,754.20 $11,262.60
with
purchase of
$300.00 -
COMPLETE SIMPAD SYSTEM 15" laptop
Laerdal 200-30001 Laerdal 200-30001 Laerdal 200-30001 & 200- |Laerdal 200-30001 Laerdal 200-30001
Model 30001PP
1 Year 1 Year Manufacturers Warranty, 1 Year 1 Year
Warranty See Attached




Joliet Junior College
Bid for Nursing & Ultrasound Program Instructional Equipment
11/30/2015
Pocket Nurse Products Unlimited Gaumard. Scientific Gaumard. Scientific Sundaes Novelty Laerdal Medical Armstrong Medical Moore Medical
(Option A) (Option B)
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION
Total $26,787.03 $48,228.13 $37,152.00 $24,885.00 $6,749.00 $29,160.69 $22,998.00 $21,012.21
Certification of Contract Bidder X X X X X X X X
Addendum Acknowledgement X X X

Refer to Pocket Nurse quote
32456; average delivery
time after receipt of PO 1-4

Notes weeks

No Bid:
Nasco




